Bouthilette, Theresa

From: LaFountain, Jennifer

Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2014 8:34 AM

To: Bouthilette, Theresa, Turati, Lori; Goodhind, Susan
Subject: FW: Have you Rec'd my Real Estate Tax?

I've responded to the questions but he wants to have the address changed for real estate
bills and water bills.

Thanks!

Jennifer LaFountain
Assistant Collector
Town of Amherst
4 Boltwood Ave
Amherst, MA 010862

Phone: 413-259-3020
Fax: 413-259-2401
lafountaini@amherstma.gov &

----- Original Message----- \NWV \\A\
From: richincalificox.net [mailto:richincalif@cox.net] (v/ \
Sent: Tuesday, January 28, 2014 7:44 PM \ Vb

To: Town of Amherst MA Collector Department

Subject: Have you Rec'd my Real Estate Tax?

Dear Collector @ Amherst, MA.

Yesterday on my pc I put through a direct debit to my bank acct to pay my real estate tax for
my family's property at:

159 N. Pleasant St.
Amherst, MA ©1002

1) Has my payment been received and posted as paid in full and up to date for all real
estate taxes?

2) Please verify that the following is in all of your systems as the mailing address for
all Real Estate Tax Bills and ALL other correspondence regarding my above listed property:

Leader, William H Trustee

Leader, W. H. Revoc, Indent. Trust
15 Center Ct,

Laguna Niguel, CA 92677

You can include my phone number (949) 939-5422 if there is ever a reason to contact me by
phone.

Thank you!




