




AMHERST PUBLIC HEALTH DEPARTMENT 

Bangs Community Center 

70 BollWood Walk 
Amherst, MA 0 I 002 

TO Elizabeth Garland 

237 Shutesbury Road 

Amhers, MA, 01002 

RE: Invoice for Title 5 Inspection Witness 

Services provided by Edmund Smith 

PAYMENT TERMS: Due Upon Receipt 

QUANTITY DESCRIPTION 

1.00 Title 5 Witness Inspection at 237 Shutesbury Road 

Please remit by check to address above - thank you. 

( 

June 2013 
INVOICE 

DATE: June 27, 2013 

UNIT PRICE 

$ 200.00 

SUBTOTAL 

SALES TAX 

TOTAL 

LINE TOTAL 

$ 200.00 

$ 200.00 

$ 200.00 
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AMHERST PUBLIC HEALTH DEPARTMENT 

Bangs Community Center 
70 Boltwood Walk 

Amherst, MA 0 1002 

TO 

RE: Invoice for 

Elizabeth Garland 

237 Shutesbury Road 

Amhers, MA, 01002 

Title 5 Inspection Witness 

Services provided by Edmund Smith 

PAYMENT TERMS: Due Upon Receipt 

QUANTITY DESCRIPTION 

1.00 Title 5 Witness Inspection at 237 Shutesbury Road 

Please remit by check to address above - thank you. 
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UNIT PRICE 
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Smith, Edmund 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 

alan [aeweiss@charter.net] 
Friday, June 07, 2013 11 :49 AM 
'Elizabeth Garland' 
Smith, Edmund 

Subject: 
Attachments: 

FW: Ti tle V inspection for 237 Shutesbury Rd, Amherst 
237 Shutesbury Road, AMh. layout.pdf 

From: alan [mailto:aeweiss@charter.net] 
Sent: Friday, June 07, 2013 11:48 AM 
To: 'Elizabeth Garland' 
Subject: RE: Title V inspection for 237 Shutesbury Rd, Amherst 

Liz, 

Attached is location map in the records that you dropped. Just take two tape measures, pu ll tight from opposite corners as 
shown and dig out cover at 1 st and 3rd septic tank location and the D. box where the trenches start. I cant tell from the 
record how deep they will be. 

Looks like Thursday the 13th at 200 pm. works. 

Alan 

From: Elizabeth Garland [ mailto:ecgarland@amherst.edu] 
Sent: Friday, June 07, 2013 11:00 AM 
To: alan 
Subject: RE : Title V inspection for 237 Shutesbury Rd, Amherst 

Hi Alan, 

We just had the septic tank pumped out last month (May), so I'm hoping we won't have to do that again. Do you think 
this will be recently enough? 

I'm fine with digging four holes, but I need to know exactly where they should be, and I gave you our map of the system, 
so we may need to coordinate on that. Are you finished looking at the paperwork? If so, can you send it back and 
indicate where we need to dig? 

Please let me know when you expect to come to the house with the Town Inspector, so we can make sure to have the 
holes dug by then. 

Thanks, 

Liz Garland 
253-3904 

From: alan [mailto:aeweiss@charter.netl 
Sent: Thursday, June 6, 2013 6:47 PM 
To: Elizabeth Garland 
Cc: 'Smith, Edmund' 
Subject: RE : Title V inspection for 237 Shutesbury Rd, Amherst 

1 





Elizabeth, 

If you know what you are doing its fine there are four holes to dig, 3 at the septic tank and one at the distribution box, we 
will also have to set up a pumper company anyhow (depending on how long since last pumped) when I and the Town 
inspector show up. 

Let me know. (i have copied Ed Smith at Amherst Health Dept to get this scheduled) . 

Best, 

Alan Weiss 
Cold Spring Environmental Consultants, Inc. 

From: Elizabeth Garland [mailto:ecgarland@amherst.edu] 
Sent: Thursday, June 06, 2013 1:36 PM 
To: aeweiss@charter.net 
Subject: Title V inspection for 237 Shutesbury Rd, Amherst 

Hi Alan, 

I just wanted to check in to see when you think you can get out here to do our Title V inspection for our house at 237 
Shutesbury Rd in Amherst. I dropped off a packet of paperwork (with all the relevant reports and diagrams) at your 
house in Belchertown last week, so I'm hoping you have everything you need for us to move forward. 

When we spoke on the phone you mentioned something about having Karl's Excavating dig out four holes? Is this 
someth ing we could do ourselves? We normally dig out the cover for emptying the system, so if we know where to dig, 
we might be able to do that for you as well. 

I look forward to hearing from you, 

Elizabeth Garland 
413-253-3904 (h) 
412-222-8825 (c) 
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